
   

Map to ENHG Meeting Venue  

Since 17 Feb 2009, all ENHG lecture meetings have 
been held at the HCT (Higher Colleges of Technology), 
Abu Dhabi Men’s College.  They will continue to be held 
at this location during the 2009-2010 season. The 
meetings start at 7:30 pm normally, but at 8:00 pm 
during Ramadan.  Here’s a map for your reference: 

Abu Dhabi Men’s College is on Al Sa’ada St.: inset 2 
(Inset 1--the Maqta Bridge approach--has been cut out.)  

 
 
The exact location of ADMC is shown in detail on 
inset #2 below: 

 

. 
Coming from Airport Road, drive down 19th/Al Sa'ada 
St., all the way to the end, and just before the Salaam 
St. overpass, take a U-turn; you'll see the Abu Dhabi 
Men's College entrance on your right.   
 
Coming from the Maqta Bridge onto Abu Dhabi Island, 
you take the first major exit, onto the East Road, or 
Eastern Ring Road, which becomes Al Salam St.  Stay 
on it until you come to the Al Sa’ada St (19

th
 St.) exit.  

Once on Al Sa’ada St., the ADMC entrance is the first 
right turn. 
 
At ADMC, drive up to the main security gate and tell 
them you’re going to a meeting, and they'll wave you 
through.  You can park in the faculty parking lot, to the 
left of the main entrance. The auditorium is just inside 
the main entrance, on the right. 
 
If you’re coming by taxi, the security guards should wave 
you through, though you may have to reassure them that 
the taxi will be coming right back out in a moment.  And 
if you ask around after the meeting, you will probably be 
able to find someone who will offer you a ride towards 
your neighbourhood.  Alternatively, you can walk out to 
the corner of Al Sa’ada Street (19

th
 St.) and Fourth 

Street (commonly known as Muroor St.), then turn right 
on Fourth/Muroor and walk to the nearest taxi bay to 
catch a taxi or a bus.  Bus #34 runs through Khalidiya to 
Marina Mall, and bus #54 runs through the tourist club 
neighbourhood to the City terminal near Abu Dhabi 
Mall).  The last buses are at 10:50 pm and 11:20 pm 
respectively--long after the meeting finishes (usually by 
9:30 pm). 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 


